P Selid Waste, Organic Waste, & Recycling

,~—
maine
.gov

Bid# 2025-028

Pine Tree Waste, Inc (Casella)

87 Pleasant Hill Rd. Scarborough, ME 04074
Chris McHale 207-604-4522

Talya Bent 603-327-9098

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 5
Item #1 Solid Waste Collection-Option 1
City Wide Curbside 467,831.00 491,223.00 515,784.00 541,573.00 568,652.00
City & School Building Collection 85,639.00 89,921.00 94,417.00 99,138.00 104,095.00
Cost of purchasing and managing waste receptacles 135,468.00 142,242.00 149,354.00 156,822.00 164,663.00
Item #2 Recycling Collection-Option 1
City Wide Curbside 467,831.00 491,223.00 515,784.00 541,573.00 568,652.00
City & School Building Collection 39.776.00 41,764.00 43,853.00 46,045.00 48,347.00
Additional Drop Off Site(s) (per hour) 265.00 289.00 303.00 318.00 334.00
Cost of purchasing and managing waste receptacles 135,468.00 142,242.00 149,354.00 156,822.00 164,663.00
Leaf Collection N/A N/A $265 per hour $278 per hour $292 per hour
Option 2-City purchases and manages cart program
|Curbside Collection of Solid Waste and Recycling 994,704.00 1,044,439.00 1,096,661.00 1,151,494.00 1,209,069.00
Bid Proposal Form Included Yes
Notarized Yes
All Bidding Documents Included Yes
Allagash Waste Services
72 Tavern Hill Windham, ME 04062
Dan Emerson
[207-650-1468
Item #1 Solid Waste Collection
City Wide Curbside No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
City & School Building Collection 125,000.00 130,000.00 135,200.00 140,600.00 146,200.00
Cost of purchasing and managing waste receptacles
Iten #2 Recycling Collection
City Wide Curbside No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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